


Freya Dalsjø is a Copenhagen based 
fashion label designed by Freya Dalsjø, 
Karis Dalsjø and Mikkel Schou.



We specialise in developing intricate 
craftsmanship, rooted in a sustainable 
practice.



We work solely with natural materials of 
the highest quality, such as wool, 
cashmere, silk, leather and silver.



We work with textile leftovers from Italian 
or French luxury houses, or directly with a 
few Italian or Spanish suppliers; 
Colombo, Raphael, Taroni, Teseo and La 
Doma.



We develop our works at our Copenhagen 
based atelier and in collaboration with 
specialised top manufactures around the 
world.



This season we are presenting styles of 
intricate craftmanship in leather. Silver 
and gold jewellery is crafted at our atelier 
in Copenhagen.



We strive to create objects of high 
aesthetic value, develop distinct and 
intricate handcraft through reworking 
traditional high end textiles. We aim to 
create sculptural yet delicate works with 
intricate detailing. Our silk work is 
embroidered at London Embroidery 
Studio and hereafter finished by hand in 
our atelier in Copenhagen.



Embroidered silk organza dress



Embroidered silk organza and silk 
duchesse dress

Sterling silver Cirkel ring

Sterling silver Kvadrat earcuff



Embroidered silk organza and silk 
duchesse coat, top, and dress

Sterling silver Cirkel ring



Embroidered silk duchesse dress and coat Sterling silver pin stack earring



Embroidered silk organza dress



Silk organza top Sterling silver Kvadrat earcuff



With our doubleface wool collection we 
attempt to create essential wardrobe 
stables, long lasting in quality and 
design. The development of these pieces 
is ongoing and the pieces stay available; 
they are not attached to a specific season. 



Our development process is careful and 
considerate, and pieces are added to the 
collection when we feel they are ready. 
We are creating a collection of pieces that 
you can mix and layer.

Pieces that meet the practical demands of 
an everyday wardrobe. Pieces that wraps 
the body in comfort.




100% cashmere vest and coat Sterling silver Kvadrat ring



100% cashmere scarf and coat



100% cashmere scarf dress Sterling silver and 18K gold ring



100% cashmere scarf and 100% wool vest



100% wool dress Sterling silver pin stack bracelet



100% doubleface wool skirt

Kvadrat leather handbag



Lamb shearling coat and scarf from La 
Doma

Sterling silver Cirkel earcuff




Lamb leather coat



Silk duchesse dress Sterling silver Cirkel ring



Silk duchesse dress Sterling silver Cirkel earcuff



Silk duchesse dress Stering silver Cirkel earcuff



Jewellery in 925 sterling silver crafted at 
our atelier in Copenhagen.

Kvadrat ring

Kvadrat ring

Kvadrat earcuff

Cirkel ring



Jewellery in 925 sterling silver and 24K 
gold plated crafted at our atelier in 
Copenhagen. 

Drape earring

Drape ring

Drape earcuff

Drape ring



Jewellery in 925 sterling silver crafted at 
our atelier in Copenhagen. 

Drape rings



Jewellery in 925 sterling silver crafted at 
our atelier in Copenhagen. 

Measuring tape collier

Measuring tape ring



Jewellery crafted at our atelier in 
Copenhagen. 925 sterling silver and 18K 
gold.



www.freyadalsjo.com


